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A guide to the natural treatment of two of the most common and damaging coinfections of Lyme disease--
Bartonella and Mycoplasma

• Reveals how these conditions often go undiagnosed, complicate Lyme treatment, and cause a host of
symptoms--from arthritis to severe brain dysfunction

• Outlines natural treatments for both infections, with herbs and supplements for specific symptoms and to
combat overreactions of the immune system

• Reviews the latest scientific research on Bartonella and Mycoplasma coinfections and how treatment with
antibiotics is often ineffective

Each year Harvard researchers estimate there are nearly 250,000 new Lyme disease infections--only 10
percent of which will be accurately diagnosed. One of the largest factors in misdiagnosis of Lyme is the
presence of other tick-borne infections, which mask or aggravate the symptoms of Lyme disease as well as
complicate treatment. Two of the most common and damaging Lyme coinfections are Bartonella and
Mycoplasma. Nearly 35 million people in the United States are asymptomatically infected with each of these
pathogens, and at least 10 percent will become symptomatic every year--with symptoms ranging from
arthritis to severe brain dysfunction.

Distilling hundreds of peer-reviewed journal articles on the latest scientific research on Bartonella,
Mycoplasma, and Lyme disease, Stephen Buhner examines the complex synergy between these infections
and reveals how all three can go undiagnosed or resurface after antibiotic treatment. He explains how these
coinfections create cytokine cascades in the body--essentially sending the immune system into an overblown,
uncontrolled response in much the same way that rheumatoid arthritis or cancer can. Detailing effective
natural holistic methods centered on herbs and supplements, such as the systemic antibacterial herb Sida
acuta, which acts to protect blood cells from invading organisms, he reveals how to treat specific symptoms,
interrupt the cytokine cascades, and bring the immune system back into balance as well as complement
ongoing Lyme disease treatments.
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From reader reviews:

Keisha Kent:

The particular book Healing Lyme Disease Coinfections: Complementary and Holistic Treatments for
Bartonella and Mycoplasma will bring that you the new experience of reading a new book. The author style
to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The
book Healing Lyme Disease Coinfections: Complementary and Holistic Treatments for Bartonella and
Mycoplasma is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site,
so you can easier to read the book.

Michele Reynolds:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to your account is Healing Lyme Disease Coinfections: Complementary and Holistic
Treatments for Bartonella and Mycoplasma this guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this
world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer
value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

Rachel Chaney:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you must do is just spending
your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. Among the books in the top record in your
reading list is usually Healing Lyme Disease Coinfections: Complementary and Holistic Treatments for
Bartonella and Mycoplasma. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing
to be precious person. By looking up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Heidi Crenshaw:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book Healing Lyme Disease Coinfections:
Complementary and Holistic Treatments for Bartonella and Mycoplasma to make your personal reading is
interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is
to be initial opinion for you to like to start a book and examine it. Beside that the book Healing Lyme
Disease Coinfections: Complementary and Holistic Treatments for Bartonella and Mycoplasma can to be a
newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse in what must you're doing of that time.
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