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"For some time George strove to keep the liaison a secret. There was a woman in the case, that he admitted.
“And not the first either,” said Ensign Spooney to Ensign Stubble. “That Osborne’s a devil of a fellow. There
was a judge’s daughter at Demerara went almost mad about him; then there was that beautiful quadroon girl,
Miss Pye, at St. Vincent’s, you know; and since he’s been home, they say he’s a regular Don Giovanni, by
Jove.”

Stubble and Spooney thought that to be a “regular Don Giovanni, by Jove” was one of the finest qualities a
man could possess, and Osborne’s reputation was prodigious amongst the young men of the regiment. He
was famous in field-sports, famous at a song, famous on parade; free with his money, which was bountifully
supplied by his father. His coats were better made than any man’s in the regiment, and he had more of them.
He was adored by the men. He could drink more than any officer of the whole mess, including old Heavytop,
the colonel. He could spar better than Knuckles, the private (who would have been a corporal but for his
drunkenness, and who had been in the prize-ring); and was the best batter and bowler, out and out, of the
regimental club. He rode his own horse, Greased Lightning, and won the Garrison cup at Quebec races.
There were other people besides Amelia who worshipped him."

- Vanity Fair, by William Makepeace Thackeray
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From reader reviews:

Dolores Watkins:

This book untitled THE COMPLETE NOVELS OF WILLIAM MAKEPEACE THACKERAY (Special
Illustrated Edition) FULL COLOR ILLUSTRATED VERSION: All Thackeray's Unabridged Novels in a ...
Thackeray (Incl. Vanity Fair) Book 1) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this is because
when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the
book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason
for you to past this publication from your list.

Daniel Kirk:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want
to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon. The THE
COMPLETE NOVELS OF WILLIAM MAKEPEACE THACKERAY (Special Illustrated Edition) FULL
COLOR ILLUSTRATED VERSION: All Thackeray's Unabridged Novels in a ... Thackeray (Incl. Vanity
Fair) Book 1) will give you new experience in looking at a book.

Kristen Mazur:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like THE COMPLETE NOVELS
OF WILLIAM MAKEPEACE THACKERAY (Special Illustrated Edition) FULL COLOR ILLUSTRATED
VERSION: All Thackeray's Unabridged Novels in a ... Thackeray (Incl. Vanity Fair) Book 1) which is
getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Ronnie Johnson:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but additionally novel and THE COMPLETE NOVELS OF WILLIAM
MAKEPEACE THACKERAY (Special Illustrated Edition) FULL COLOR ILLUSTRATED VERSION: All



Thackeray's Unabridged Novels in a ... Thackeray (Incl. Vanity Fair) Book 1) or maybe others sources were
given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel would like to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to put their
knowledge. In various other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes THE COMPLETE NOVELS
OF WILLIAM MAKEPEACE THACKERAY (Special Illustrated Edition) FULL COLOR ILLUSTRATED
VERSION: All Thackeray's Unabridged Novels in a ... Thackeray (Incl. Vanity Fair) Book 1) to make your
spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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