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Roderick Jones adopts a very practical approach to both consecutive and simultaneous interpreting,
providing detailed illustrations of note-taking, reformulation, the 'salami' technique, simplification,
generalization, anticipation, and so on, including numerous tricks-of-the-trade such as how to handle difficult
speakers and how to interpret untranslatable jokes. Numerous examples are offered at every stage, all in
English or 'foreignized' English.

Although primarily written as a practitioner's explanation rather than a theorist's speculation, the book
includes notes on concepts such as units of meaning, translation units and discourse structure, as well as
stances on more polemical issues such as the use of omission and the ethics of interpreting mistakes. The
book concludes with a comment on the pleasure of conference interpreting, as well as a glossary and
suggested further readings. In all, it fills a major gap in English-language publications on interpreting,
providing an introduction for beginners, a down-to-earth guide for students, and a handy compendium for
teachers.

The first edition of this book was published in the series Translation Theories explained, at a time when St.
Jerome had no separate series for books on practice as such. Happily, it has now found its rightful place in
the Practices series. Modifications with respect to the first edition include an updated reading list, an index,
and guideline tasks for training sessions. The popularity of the book since its first appearance in 1998
suggests that little else needs to be changed.
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From reader reviews:

John Pasko:

The book Conference Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained) can give more knowledge
and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the best thing like a book Conference
Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer
along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you
may share all of these. Book Conference Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained) has simple
shape however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide
open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Brenda Rodriguez:

Typically the book Conference Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained) will bring you to
definitely the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you
try to find new book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Conference Interpreting
Explained (Translation Practices Explained) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-
book from official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Eugene Williams:

The book Conference Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained) has a lot info on it. So when
you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after scanning this book.

Joseph Russell:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you study a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
forms of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, along with soon. The Conference Interpreting Explained (Translation Practices Explained) will give
you new experience in looking at a book.
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