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In the 1970s, in the small rural community of Jerusalem, New York, Jenny Thompson has reached a turning
point in her life. About to finish her senior year of high school, the country girl loves the lush land of her
family s farm, the heady scent of dogwood and the brilliant reds of summer sunsets. Yet she dreams of
escaping to college and pursuing a career as an artist. The feminist wave has not yet reached Jerusalem,
however. All Jenny s bitter, overbearing mother wants is for her to marry...well.

But who s a suitable match? Growing up, Jenny has forged a close, heart-to-heart friendship with Jake
Martin the gentle Mennonite boy her mother considers an unseemly outsider. As hardworking and idealistic
as he is poor, Jake wants to be a lawyer to help those like himself. Though sad to part with Jenny, he has
only good wishes for her when she marries Bud, the richest and most popular boy at school.

The traditional marriage is a mistake, Jenny soon realizes. Divorced, she and her son move to New York
where she discovers new artistic talents and a growing sense of empowerment. At the peak of her success, a
turn of events reconnects her with Jake, now a high-powered attorney. Together they return to Jerusalem
where a second chance in a changing world awaits them.

Told with keen insight into character and an eye for nature s beauty, Back to Jerusalem vividly captures both
the easy rhythm of farm life, and the fast-paced hustle and bustle of New York City. Along with an inside
look at the Mennonite and the English, Surasky deftly illuminates the challenges of women seeking
liberation in the 70s.

Back to Jerusalem is a poignant, jubilant homecoming readers are sure to celebrate.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Cook:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice through
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yep, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is high. In your case
who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Back to Jerusalem book as basic and daily
reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

James Hubbard:

The book Back to Jerusalem has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot
of profit. The book was written by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior to write
this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after scanning this book.

Anthony Anderson:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book
entitled Back to Jerusalem the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that
maybe unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a guide then
become one type conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The Back to Jerusalem giving
you one more experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful info for your better life
with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind are going to be pleased
when you are finished reading through it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling
out spare time activity?

Elmer Pereira:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This publication Back to Jerusalem was filled regarding science. Spend your
extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different
feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a
publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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