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SONGS OF MY SELFIE: An Anthology of Millennial Stories celebrates the millennial through the works of
up-and-coming fiction writers, all under the age of twenty-six. This collection features seventeen short
stories by millennial writers about actual millennial issues, exposing this generation's true ambitions and
frustrations, humor and heartbreak, despair and joie de vivre.

With fresh new voices and edgy prose, these compelling stories offer a cross-section of vibrant millennial
characters: unemployed grads deep in debt, expectant mothers on the cusp of adulthood, online relationship
addicts, and millennials at war with their families' expectations—even while stuck living at home. Here are
the strong and the weak, the self-aware and those who reject reality—all carefully crafted to buck the
common perception of the millennial. And yet, with a knowing wink, each story is accompanied by a selfie
of its author.

Forget what the media says—SONGS OF MY SELFIE reveals what it really means to be twenty-something
today.
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From reader reviews:

Charline Fendley:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well,
probably you will require this Songs of My Selfie: An Anthology of Millennial Stories.

Sharon Keller:

This Songs of My Selfie: An Anthology of Millennial Stories usually are reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason of this Songs of My Selfie: An Anthology of
Millennial Stories can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
studying food but feed you actually with information that might be will shock your previous knowledge. This
book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed
people. Beside that this Songs of My Selfie: An Anthology of Millennial Stories giving you an enormous of
experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day
activity. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Thomas Ellis:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Songs of
My Selfie: An Anthology of Millennial Stories, you are able to tells your family, friends and soon about
yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Roberta Lawrence:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real their
hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to can't see colorful
pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this
period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this Songs of My Selfie: An Anthology of Millennial Stories can make you truly feel more
interested to read.
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