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My name is Slade Merrick and I’m a fucking sex addict . . . I’ve been told it’s a problem. But I see it as a
passion; something that I’m good at. And who the fuck stops something that they’re good at? They want me
to seek help; get my cock in check. Don't judge my lifestyle. You’re no better than me. Just admit it, you like
to fuck too. Sex is what I do best; my own personal high, so I embrace it instead of being ashamed. When
I'm not fucking, I'm slinging drinks at Walk Of Shame or stripping my way into your bed; another thing I'm
good at. Every woman’s darkest fantasy brought to life. So, am I stopping? Fuck no. Sex is beautiful, raw
and erotic and I get off knowing I can have it with anyone I want . . . with the exception of her. Aspen. She
walks into the club swaying those hips, instantly drawing my cock to attention. She’s pure perfection. That
is, until she opens that mouth, drawing me in and for the first time in forever I want something more than
sex. I want her and she hates it. Things get dirty. Dirty is what I like; it’s how I live. But . . . she’s playing a
game she can never win. ***Author's note*** Due to strong language and a very high amount of dirty,
sexual content, this book is not intended for readers under the age of 18. This is #1 in the Walk Of Shame
series of novellas that will all be STANDALONE reads. If you're not into, cocky bad boys with filthy
mouths and even filthier sex, then this series is not for you. If you are . . . then, come meet the dirty boys of
Walk Of Shame.
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From reader reviews:

Mike Jones:

The book Slade (Walk Of Shame #1) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book Slade (Walk Of Shame #1)?
Some of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that will book can give many information for
us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or information that you
take for that, you are able to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Slade (Walk Of
Shame #1) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the
enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Lorenza Jones:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book might be option to fill your
totally free time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If
you want to test look for book, may be the publication untitled Slade (Walk Of Shame #1) can be great book
to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Edward White:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By the
book Slade (Walk Of Shame #1) we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being
creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up
being doubt to change your life with this book Slade (Walk Of Shame #1). You can more pleasing than now.

Marilynn Johnson:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update
of news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book,
new and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just searching for the Slade (Walk Of Shame #1) when you desired it?
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